
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-19032

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL One Time Purchase of Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS)

FOR: Units for Instrumentation

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 27, 2019
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 UNIT

120 ea. PRICE  975.95 992.69 1,100.90 1,130.17 1,980.00

1. APC Smart UPS Unit-UPSXP - 1500VA, 120 Volts TOTAL NO BID 117,114.00 119,122.80 132,108.00 135,620.40 237,600.00

**

Mfr./Part No. Quoting 9PX1500RT UPSXLA UPSXLA UPSXLA N1C L2000

*

TOTAL TOTAL NO BID 117,114.00 119,122.80 132,108.00 135,620.40 237,600.00

GROUP 2 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 56,450.00   64,583.00  

1. New Uninterruptible Power System (UPS) Unit Eaton 93PM, 150 K UPS Unit TOTAL 56,450.00 NO BID NO BID 64,583.00 NO BID

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 90,588.00   119,797.00  

2. New UPS Unit - Lithium for batteries TOTAL 90,588.00 NO BID NO BID 119,797.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 30,848.00   67,473.00  

3. Labor for New UPS Installation and Removal of Existing UPS Unit TOTAL 30,848.00 NO BID NO BID 67,473.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 2,982.00   5,000.00  

4. Existing UPS Unit - Battery Disposal TOTAL 2,982.00 NO BID NO BID 5,000.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 0.00   0.00  

5. Trade in Offer for Existing UPS Unit TOTAL 0.00 NO BID NO BID 0.00 NO BID

2 hr Load

Bank Test

3,800.00

*  

   

TOTAL TOTAL 184,668.00 NO BID NO BID 256,853.00 NO BID

   

2% 2% 1% Net 1%

Terms 10 days 10 days 10 days 30 days 10 days

 

Delivery 63 days 7 days 30 days 84 days 35 days

*Low Bidder       

** Price includes network cards.
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BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

ABLe Communications, Inc.

AccuTek Technologies Fisk Electric Company Sequel Data Systems, Inc.

Advanced Connections Inc. GCS Technologies, Inc. SHI Government Solutions, Inc.

Advanced Connections Inc. General Datatech, L.P. Siemens Industry, Inc.

Aerowave Technologies Gerard Electric Sigma Technology Solutions, Inc.

Alterman Electric GovConnection, Inc Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc

Anixter, Inc. GTS Technology Solutions, Inc. Skyhawk Security, LLC

Avatech Technology Solutions, Inc. HiEd Inc. Solid IT Networks, Inc.

Avisolve, LLC IE Smart Systems Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc.

Bass Computers, Inc. Insight Public Sector, Inc. Spectrum Imaging Technologies, Inc.

Big State Electric Level One Technology Sterling Computers Corporation

Brisk Worldwide LLC Logical Front, LLC Summus Industries, Inc

Cates Control Systems Mark III Systems Incorporated Sunrise IT Solutions Group

CDW Government, LLC Mission City Electric Superior Fiber & Data Services, Inc.

CDW Government, LLC Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. TanChes Global Management, Inc.

 Central Electric Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. Technologent

Centre Technologies, Inc. Network Cabling Services, Inc. Technology Assets, LLC dba Global Asset Online

Centre Technologies, Inc. PC Specialists, Inc. dba Technology Integration Group (TIG) Technology for Education LLC dba TFE

CENTRYS, LLC Penn-Delmar Power Technology Integration Group (TIG)

CenturyLink Communications, LLC Pfeiffer & Son, LTD Teletouch Communications, Inc.

Checkpoint Services, Inc. Pivot Solutions, North America, Inc. dba Sigma Technology Solutions, Inc. Tero Technologies, Inc

Commonwealth Computer Company Porter Burgess Company dba Flair Data Systems The Aldridge Company

Commonwealth Computer Company Precision Task Group, Inc. The Mirazon Group, LLC

Communications Supply Corporation (CSC) Preferred Technologies LLC The Personal Computer Store, Inc. dba Avinext

Crystal Communications, LTD Premier Logitech, LLC Unique Digital Technology, Inc.

CST Corp Presidio Networked Solutions Group, LLC VIA Technology

Datavox, Inc Presidio Networked Solutions Group, LLC Victoria Communication Services, Inc.

Delcom Group, LP Prime Systems/Directron Virtual Communication Specialists, LLC

DeltaWare Inc. Resonant Technology Partners, Inc. Waypoint Business Solutions

Design Security Controls, LTD. RSW Technologies, Inc. Weaver Technologies, LLC

Electra Link, Inc. S&P Communications Xiotech Corporation

EST Group, L.L.C. Securadyne Systems Texas, LLC

Evolve Holdings, Inc Demandstar

Exasales, LLC NO BID:  CDW SAWS Website

Fisk Electric GDT

Presidio

SCW
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